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KEY  FACTS

Founded in 1893 by Jacques Tschumi as a hotel school,
then developed by the Société Suisse des Hôteliers, EHL is
the world’s first hospitality and business management
university providing undergraduate and graduate
programs at its campuses in Lausanne and Chur-Passugg
with the Singapore campus opening in 2021, as well as
innovative online learning solutions.
Information about the university’s mission and course
structures can be found through this video and on EHL’s
main website. 
 

Their programmes balance practical work with crucial
theoretical studies designed to give ambitious students an
excellent grounding in e-commerce, crisis management,
technology and international relations. The school’s faculty
of world-renowned industry specialists has been
incorporating a strong focus on learning in data
management, tech-first systems and flexible working. The
researchers behind EHL’s Hospitality Insights hub are also
on hand to provide ‘boost to business’ tips and data on
topics such as international tourism and GDP.

All degrees are delivered by EHL, which is recognized as a
Swiss University of Applied Science and which has an
American (NECHE) accreditation. They also comply with
the Bologna requirements using the European Credit
Transfer System (ECTS). For the last two consecutive

years, EHL has ranked number 1 by QS World University
Ranking for Hospitality and Leisure Management and by
CEO World ranking. EHL has also received the award for
“best innovation in education” at the Worldwide
Hospitality Awards 2019 for the Bachelor in International
Hospitality Management program, following multi-campus
study options and the entrepreneurial support provided to
the students. This international distinction reinforced the
strong recognition of EHL within the hospitality industry.

During a turbulent period for many businesses worldwide,
EHL has remained at the forefront of innovation with the
development of a Hyflex learning model – designed to
streamline a mix of classroom presence and interaction,
campus life and remote courses with the support of a VR
learning programme based on the ‘gamification’ of the
classroom.
 
 
 

Its campus training restaurant ‘Berceau des Sens’,
operated fully by students, is the only one of its kind to
hold a Michelin Star for two consecutive years.  It also
holds the highest Gault & Millau score for a restaurant in
its category. EHL  strives for innovation and excellence
and remains committed to enhancing the learning and
career opportunities for students.

LOCATION AND ACCESS

The EHL campus is situated on the hillside above
Lausanne, one of Switzerland’s most popular cities,
combining a historical centre alongside trendy bars,
restaurants and stores. With easy public transportation,
students can explore other Swiss cities and visit the
capitals of Europe, only a short flight away.

Geneva Airport: 69km | 40 minute drive

Geneva town centre: 71 km | 50 minute drive

Lausanne town: 7.8km | 12 minute drive
Montreux town: 30 km | 30 minute drive

FACILITIES

https://staging.globalthoughtleaders.org/ehl-group/
https://www.ehl.edu/
https://hospitalityinsights.ehl.edu/
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The campus offers the best features of a Swiss hospitality
school combining a dynamic and international business
environment. Students enjoy convenient accommodations
and food & beverage outlets, alongside purpose-built
practical learning spaces and academic facilities. The
facilities at EHL support rigorous academic learning, a
healthy lifestyle and interactions with industry leaders and
peers.
 

A new eco-friendly campus is scheduled for completion in
2021, which was designed by students to incorporate
social design and the surrounding  natural environment for
maximum inspiration. It will meet Minergie-P © standards
for energy efficiency and comfort, and will function as a

healthy eco-system with an organic orchard, replanting of
local trees, and a running trail around the campus.

Students are encouraged to embrace healthy living,
refinement and social engagement. Students participate in
numerous social committees, art and culture clubs and
sports associations.

EHL offers facilities and resources for students to stay fit
and lead an active lifestyle independently. Group classes
and individual sports offer students the chance for
personal development on campus.

The student experience – from the facilities, to the
committees, events and excursions – is designed to enrich
students’ lives well beyond their university years.

DID  YOU KNOW?

EHL has over 120 nationalities among its students.

EHL’s alumni of 25,000 includes a wealth of international
industry leaders across the world’s most renowned hotel
groups and iconic properties, with UK graduates applying
their skills in top jobs at brands including Soho House &
Co, The Dorchester Collection, D&D Group and the
Eccleston Square Hotel.

EHL has rapidly grown its dynamic Women in Leadership
initiative, which aims to foster improved gender equality
among leadership roles across sectors.

EHL Group encompasses a portfolio of specialised
business units that deliver hospitality management
education and innovation worldwide. Headquartered in
Lausanne, Switzerland, the Group includes: EHL Ecole
hôtelière de Lausanne, EHL Swiss School of Tourism

and Hospitality and EHL Advisory Services.

EHL Swiss School of Tourism and Hospitality is one of the
leading hospitality management schools for hotel
specialists for 50 years. It delivers Swiss-accredited
federal diplomas of vocational education and training and
of higher education, from its location in a 19th century
spa-hotel in Chur-Passugg, Graubünden, to Swiss and
international students from 20 countries.

EHL Advisory Services is an organisation that has become
Switzerland’s largest hospitality advisory company
specialising in service culture implementation, business
consulting, as well as the development and quality
assurance of learning centres. EHL Advisory Services has
offices in Lausanne, Beijing, Shanghai and New Delhi and
as delivered mandates in more than 60 countries over the
past 40 years.

https://www.ehl.edu/
https://www.ehl.edu/
https://www.ssth.ch/
https://www.ssth.ch/
http://www.lhcconsulting.com/
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